
Est Qty Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost Make& Model Unit Cost Total Cost

600 As Spec $360.50 $216,300.00 As Spec $442.15 $265,290.00 AeroHive550 $483.67 $290,202.00 Meraki $503.19 $301,914.00 AeroHive650 $599.55 $359,730.00 As Spec $820.00 $492,000.00 As Spec $749.91 $449,946.00 As Spec $870.61 $522,366.00

1 As Spec $46,258.77 $46,258.77 As Spec $27,838.00 $27,838.00 AeroHive550 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 As Spec $19,499.00 $19,499.00 As Spec $97,871.79 $97,871.79 As Spec $120,309.44 $120,309.44

B18-05 Extreme Access 

Points Tabsheet

Description

Extreme Networks 

Access Point                   

Model: WS-AP3935i-

FCC

Extreme Networks 

Controller

Model: C5210 WLAN 

Controller

Lockstep Technology

Notes Awarded Contract 

CDWG

$262,558.77

AV Excellence

$511,499.00

A3 Communications

$547,817.79$290,202.00Total Cost

PC Solutions

$293,128.00

Net Planner

$642,675.44

TIG

$301,914.00

CDWG

$359,730.00


